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BACKGROUND AND OBJECTIVES

The Child-3afe Packaging Group requested an assessmenl of the child resistance
properties gf a blisterpack among children aged 42 - 51 monihs (as specified in 05
EN 28317 fer child-resistant contalners and in the US proiocuol).
The pack was made from 20 micron hard-tempered aluminium foil, coated on
the dull side with heat scal, and 250 micron opague white UPVC
ipharmaceutical grade).

Each blister pack contained 15 placebo tabiets, 300 units were supplied from
which the test samples were selected at random.

There is no UK protucol for testing bubblepacks, de facto or 1o drait.
The USA protocol was examined and it was decided:
al 1o follow the procedures outlined in this document
bl torestrict the quota sample of children tested 10 40 and to enter the resulis
sequentially using the statistical charts emploved currently for EN 150 28317
and hitherto for BS 6652,
METHOD
A quota sample of 40 children aged 42 - 51 months was recruited (Appendix A). 3
nursery schools and playgroups were visiled, sufficentlv diverse in catchment area
lo cover social classes B/ C1/C2/D. Two children were from ethnic minonites.
The children were tested in pairs in the environment familiar b them
Initially they were handed a blisterpack and told:
“Twant wou o v and upen these, vou can do anything you like™

50% received the pack blister uppermost  nd 30% foil up

5 minutes was allowed fur opening and the nunber accessed in that time was
recorded.

After 5 minutes children who bad nol yel accessed all 75 tablets received a
demonstration [rom the Behavioural Researcher and were told:

"Please o on 1r-,ring to apen these, you can use your teuth if you like™.

A further 3 minules was allowed for opening i.e. 10 minutes in total.



s

All children remained in the test area for the full 10 minutes uniess both of the nair
had accessed all 15 tablets.

This procedure accords with the USA protocol.

Behavioural researchers noted:
al The number of tablets accessed pre-demonstrauon,
] The number of tablet; accessed post-demanstration.
<l The number of tablets accessed in total

a) Whether 3 tablets had been accessed because 3 paracetamol can kil a
child of this age, and the time taken to achieve this.

gl Whether ali 15 tablets had been accassed and the nme raken.

SUPERVISION OF TESTING
All testing was carried out under the supecvition of;

[Hll Cawthorne, MBE: Saruor Partner
Siobhan Pallusel: Senior Behavioural Researcher

of Burford Research Consultanis (see Appendix Bl

On the first dav of testing [an Parker of Dragoa Plastics was present as an observer.

LOCATION AND TIMING OF TESTING

Testing was <arried out between 6th and 17th July 1995 in Brackreil, Maidenhead
and Woodley, Beckshire.



RESULTS
The following comments are based on data in tables 1 - 4.

1 Number accessed

37 (92.5% of the 40 children accessed at least 3 tablets pre-demonstration,
18 (45% ) accessed all 15 ) £,

2 (15%) opened 1 - 14 I
%{22.5%) opened 6- & '

Imtotal, 3zr 10 minutes besting;

36 (90%) had accessed al] 15 tabiets and oniv 1 child had opened less

thar 3. (Table 1)
2 Times taken to access tablets
il 3 taliets
16 (40% ) children accessed 3 tabiets onone minuts or lass,
104257 rook 101 - 3 minutes and a farther 3 3.01 « 4 minutes. Le. 34 (83%

ook under 4 minutes

BHIT fablers

1-Zmins 3 5 =8 mins i

1-3 3) 12 a-7 3 17
3-4 7} H23%) 7-8 ) H23%)
4-3 4] &-9 P

Time taken has been analvsed in Table 3 ov 2ex and age. Sub-bases are too
bowe for valid comment bur no observable welghting vis 4 vis sample structure
l# recorded. One might have anticipated thas older children would outstrip:
WOURZEr Ones. (Tables 2and 3)



3 Methods used to open

These can be summarised as follows:

% Mo
Initially: Flexed pack 35 14 {13 foil uppermost)
Picked foil open
With nail /fingertip 325 13
Pushed down on bubbles 25 I
Pressad up on bubbles 10 4
o Mo
Subsequent activities:
Poked out tablets with
finger/ nail 45 18
Tablets released as
prezzed down 30 1z
Peeled off foil after tearing 25 10 {2 bent off
corner of pack)

Nozes flexing of pack
@as=2 of picking foil apen and tearing oif in & strip
wre third used pressure on bubbles to sccess tablets
facility with which small fingers poked out tablets

CONCLUSION

This pack can not be considered to be child-resistant.



Appendix A

SAMPLE STRUCTURE OF CHILDREN

Ape (monthsh Boys Girls Total

51 3 2 5
50 3 1 +
49 1 2 4
b ie) 2 2 4
EE 2 3
4 1 3 e
43 2 2 4
44 2 2 4
13 2 2 1
il 1 | -

E—



Appendix B

Burford Research Consultants was founded in 1967 a5 an independent research
house. [t remains independent.

CRC Testing
From 1575 CRC testing formalised by BSI for pharmaceuticals.
BRC accredited (BS3321)
1985 CRE testing extended to non-pharmaceuticals.
BRC accredited {BS6652 which later subsumad 5321)
1aas: I50 EN 28317 replaced B58652. BRC is the sole UK

company aceredited by NAMAS,
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Table 1

NUMBER OF TABLETS ACCESSED PRE AND POST DEMONSTRATION

Base: 40 Pre-dem. Pre and Post-dem
(5 runutes; {10 minutes)
Na. g Mo, %a
15 15 4543 36 S0
1 1 5 3 a
13 1 g - -
12 2 5.0 -
il 1 2.5 -
iQ 1 25 -
o 1 L5 =
8 3 7.5 - -
7 1 25 - -
o 3 ;. 25
g 3 7.3 E
4 1 25 1 25
3 % 2.5 - -
1 1 23 1 2.5
0 ol 5.0 - -
Mot recorded o - - 1 25

@ gxcluded due to Hming fatlure post-dem,



Table 2

TIME TAKEN TO ACE¥FL 5 3 TABLETS

113 TABLETS
Base: 40 3 15
1-3secs 7 -
10 I =
20 i -

30 3

4 1 -
43 2 -
1 minwee 1 -
1.1 -2.00 4 3
201300 & 3
308 =400 B 7
4.01 - 3.40 1 4
5.01 -6.00 1 7
6.01-7.00 ] 3
7.01 - 8.00 - 5
801-9.00 - 2
$.01-10.00 - -
Failed to accass 1 3
Time not recorded 2 3

MNaotes Less than five minutes or less = pre-demonsiration

Maximum time available = 10 minutes

Dome times not recorded on Dav 1 as not all children on video
Sabsequent test days timings taken with stopwatches.

This is ot part of the US prowcol.



Table 3

ANALYSIS OF OPENING TIMES BY AGE AND SEX

A: 3 Tablets

Pre-Dem

1 munute or less
1.01 - 3.00

301 -3.00

Post-dem
5.1 - 700
7.01-10.00
Failed/

not recorded

TOTAL OFENED),

SAMPLE

B: 15 Tabiets

Pre-dem

1 minute or less
1,01 -3.00

3.05 - 5.

Post-dem
S41-7.00

701 -9.00

901 - 10.00
Failed to access
Time not recorded

TOTAL OFENED
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FIGURE 2: AFTER DEMONSTRATION
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FIGURE 2: AFTER DEMONSTRATION
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Figure 1: Without Demanstration
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